
Amount
$250,000.00

Entity Name Contact Name
Address Position/Title
City/State/Zip Telephone
Entity Type

Fiscal Year 2023 Fiscal Year 2024 Fiscal Year 2025 Total
$19,726.00 $50,981.23 $50,981.23 -$31,255.23
$22,000.00 $21,550.00 $21,550.00 $450.00
$10,000.00 $2,537.86 $2,537.86 $7,462.14
$58,810.00 $668.75 $668.75 $58,141.25

$2,582.15 $2,582.15 -$2,582.15
$0.00 $0.00

Turfgrass for Playground $150,000.00 $157,217.12 $157,217.12 -$7,217.12
$4,672.23 $4,672.23 -$4,672.23

$9,790.66 $9,790.66 $9,790.66 $0.00
$270,326.66 $240,209.34 $9,790.66 $0.00 $250,000.00 $20,326.66

___ Project is underway _X __  Project is complete, funds are exhausted Project completion date  ___________________________________________

___ Project yet to be started Estimated start date  _____________________________________ Estimated completion date  ___________________________________________

Organization Signature Title

Printed Name Date

Description

171 Langford Road Assistant Town Administrator
(803) 754-0501

Municipality

Accounting of how the funds have been spent:

Assistant Town Administraator

State of South Carolina Fiscal Year Spending Report
This form is designed to collect the information required by South Carolina in accordance with Proviso 117.21 of the appropriations act of 2022 and Executive Order 2022-19.  
This form must be submitted to the state agency that is providing the contribution for the designated organization. The state agency providing the contribution should use this 
form to collect fiscal year spending information from the designated organization.  

Contribution Information
State Agency Providing the Contribution Earmark name

Organization Certifications

Nonsecurity

1. Security Gates: Have reduced vandalism and increased security for Doko Park. The primary benfits have been reduction in repair costs and increased safety for park users.                                                              
2. Tag Readers/Cameras: These have complimented the gates in reducing vandelism and increasing park security.                                                                                                                                          3. 
Security Planters: Aesthetically pleasing and reduce the chances of vehicular traffic circulating in the park coming in contact with users of the playground.                                                              4. 

Turfgrass for Playground: This has provided a NPSI certified playground surface that drastically reduced maintenance cost and maintains compliance year round, reducing the Towns liability costs 
and increasing playground safety for the users.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          5. Speedhumps & 

Tables: Speedhumps have increased safety by slowing park traffic down. Picnic Tables have provided a place for users to eat, relax or take a break from their activities.                                                                                                                                                                    

Please provide a detailed spending summary, goals that were accomplished, and how the expenses benefit the public.  If project is yet to be started, provide an 
explanation.

P280 - Department of Parks, Recreation, and Tourism Doko Meadows Park Security Upgrades

Organization Information Organization Contact Information
Town of Blythewood Daniel Stines

Daniel Stines 6/11/2024

Blythewood, SC 29016+

Purchase and Installation of a Security Gates at Doko Meadows Park
Purchase and Installation of Tag readers and cameras around Town Hall 
Security planters surrounding the playground

Grand Total

The Organization certifies that the funds have been expended in accordance with the plan provided to the agency providing the distribution and for a public purpose.  

Security Camera maintenance

Speedbumps and picnic tables
Land purchase

Trail light repair

Budget
Expenditures

Balance







From: Brian (Ashley) A Berry
To: Carroll Williamson
Cc: kambrellgarvin@gmail.com; Julie Emory
Subject: RE: Blythewood $250,000 earmark
Date: Tuesday, April 23, 2024 11:15:12 AM

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the Town of Blythewood. Maintain caution when opening external
links/attachments

Good morning, Carroll,
 
Yes, this is perfect, thank you.  Have a great day!  -Ashley
 
Ashley Berry
Finance Director
South Carolina Department of Parks, Recreation & Tourism
1205 Pendleton Street, Suite 517
Columbia, SC 29201
803-734-1759, Office
803-351-1775, Mobile

SCPRT.com
 

 
 

 
 
From: Carroll Williamson <williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, April 23, 2024 11:13 AM
To: Brian (Ashley) A Berry <aberry@scprt.com>
Cc: kambrellgarvin@gmail.com; Julie Emory <emoryj@townofblythewoodsc.gov>
Subject: Blythewood $250,000 earmark
 
Good morning Ashley,
 
I spoke with Representative Kambrell Garvin, who had obtained this earmark for the Town.   He told
me that he approves the use of the remaining funds to go towards the purchase of property adjacent
to Doko Meadows Park.  I have copied him on this email.  Is this all you need?
 

Carroll
Carroll Williamson
Town Administrator
williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov
 

mailto:aberry@scprt.com
mailto:/o=ExchangeLabs/ou=Exchange Administrative Group (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/cn=Recipients/cn=e54a5b49444041c48aea3243a7f0dd46-Carroll Wil
mailto:kambrellgarvin@gmail.com
mailto:emoryj@townofblythewoodsc.gov
http://www.scprt.com/
https://discoversouthcarolina.com/
mailto:williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov


PO Box 1004 |  171 Langford Rd |  Blythewood, SC 29016
803-754-0501  |  803-754-0563-fax | website 
 
From: Brian (Ashley) A Berry <aberry@scprt.com> 
Sent: Thursday, July 6, 2023 12:34 PM
To: Carroll Williamson <williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov>
Cc: Julie Emory <emoryj@townofblythewoodsc.gov>
Subject: RE: Town of Blythewood Expenditure Report
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside the Town of Blythewood. Maintain caution when opening external

links/attachments
 

Yes, it is good, I just need it to be signed and submitted.  Thanks  -Ashley
 
Ashley Berry
Finance Director
South Carolina Department of Parks, Recreation & Tourism
1205 Pendleton Street, Suite 517
Columbia, SC 29201
803-734-1759, Office
803-351-1775, Mobile

SCPRT.com
 

 
 
 
 

From: Carroll Williamson <williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, July 6, 2023 12:05 PM
To: Brian (Ashley) A Berry <aberry@scprt.com>
Cc: Julie Emory <emoryj@townofblythewoodsc.gov>
Subject: RE: Town of Blythewood Expenditure Report
 
Ashley,
 
Following up on this to see if you have had a chance to review it.  Thanks.
 
Carroll
 
Carroll Williamson
Town Administrator

http://www.townofblythewoodsc.gov/
mailto:aberry@scprt.com
mailto:williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov
mailto:emoryj@townofblythewoodsc.gov
http://www.scprt.com/
https://discoversouthcarolina.com/
https://discoversouthcarolina.com/
mailto:williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov
mailto:aberry@scprt.com
mailto:emoryj@townofblythewoodsc.gov


williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov
 

PO Box 1004 |  171 Langford Rd |  Blythewood, SC 29016
803-754-0501  |  803-754-0563-fax | website 
 
From: Carroll Williamson 
Sent: Friday, June 30, 2023 10:36 AM
To: Brian (Ashley) A Berry <aberry@scprt.com>
Cc: Julie Emory <emoryj@townofblythewoodsc.gov>
Subject: Town of Blythewood Expenditure Report
 
Ashley,
  Can you please review the expenditure report for the earmark Titled Doko Meadows Park Security
Upgrades?  I have also included all of the receipts.
 
Carroll Williamson
Town Administrator
williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov
 

PO Box 1004 |  171 Langford Rd |  Blythewood, SC 29016
803-754-0501  |  803-754-0563-fax | website 
 

mailto:williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov
http://www.townofblythewoodsc.gov/
mailto:aberry@scprt.com
mailto:emoryj@townofblythewoodsc.gov
mailto:williamsonc@townofblythewoodsc.gov
http://www.townofblythewoodsc.gov/
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